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©  Scientific problem. In recent decades, the 
radical changes have occured in the world in 
the approach used by the state to meet eco-
nomic challenges, one of which is the problem 
of increasing innovation and investment activ-
ity in agribusiness. The private sector, inves-
tors, science and government are increasingly 
entering into cooperation in search for effective 
ways to meet the challenges of innovation and 
investment development, and growth of agri-
business on the basis of public- private partner-
ship, since it is just the latter that is able to 
promote the implementation of innovation and 
investment programs. 
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Analysis of recent researches and publica-
tions. Theoretical and applied aspects of the 
creation of public-private partnerships institute, 
and use of its technologies to enhance innova-
tion and investment activity in agribusiness 
have been fragmentarily highlighted in scien-
tific studies of V. Ambrosov, V. Heiiets, O. 
Hudz, P. Sabluk,  M. Savluk,  V. Senchahov, P. 
Stetsiuk et al.  Appreciating and duly noting the 
importance of existing creative works, however 
it should be noted the lack of scientific devel-
opments with respect to proposals concerning 
the well-defined construction of theoretical and 
methodological basis for the formation of the 
institute of public-private partnerships as a 
condition for increasing innovation and invest-
ment activity in agribusiness, as well as the 
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possibilities for using new approaches 
to cooperation of private agribusiness, science 
and state that are adequate to challenges and 
threats of modern economic space, which meet 
the needs of thr society. 

The objective of the article. The objective 
of the paper is to identify the role of the insti-
tute of public-private partnerships in  enhancing 
innovation and investment activity in agribusi-
ness, and in outlining the directions of motiva-
tional enhancement component in the mecha-
nisms formation for interaction between state, 
science, investors and agricultural producers. 

Statement of the main results of the study. 
 One of the mechanisms that characterises the 
new economic approach is the interaction be-
tween public authorities and businesses. Private 
agricultural business, investors, science and the 
state in search for effective solutions to social 
problems of agrarian business based on the 
public-private partnerships, since it is just that 
partnership that is able to promote the imple-
mentation of innovation and investment pro-
grams of agribusiness modernization with the 
lowest public expenditures and social losses. 

Public-private partnerships take various 
forms under established statutory,  contractual 
and other relations between public institutions, 
enterprises and non- public business entities, in-
cluding these in agriculture [8 p.18]. Today, in-
novation and investment activity in the agrarian 
business is underdeveloped, and therefore there 
is no proper interaction between business, sci-
ence and state. Fundamental principle of modern 
approach to the formation of research and inno-
vation systems , which make the high – tech ba-
sis of the effective development for competitive 
sectors of the economy, is the distinction be-
tween the functional purpose and productive ca-
pacity of scientific-technical and innovation 
fields [12]. "It is the model of public-private 
partnerships that is able to fill gaps in this area, 
and  establish the required rules for all the par-
ticipants of the innovation market" [10]. 

The development of public-private partner-
ships in innovation and  investment area pro-
vides an opportunity to attract significant in-
vestment resources , which facilitate the im-
plementation of promising innovative projects 
and allow to reduce the burden on the state 
budget. The main objective here is to create a 

favorable business climate enabling the private 
capital to invest heavily in domestic innova-
tions, and implement them [4]. 

The public-private partnerships can be con-
sidered a key mechanism of agribusiness inno-
vation modernization. Its high efficiency as a 
technology of cooperation between the state, 
science, investors and business has been proven 
through practices of many countries. In particu-
lar, in 2010 over 100 projects on public- private 
partnership basis  at total value of about 18.3 
billion euros were carried out in the European 
Union. It should be noted that most of them 
have been implemented in the field of educa-
tion (34%), transport (21%), health 
(17%). Today 50 projects amounting to 8 bil-
lion euros, and 23 in the amount of 1.5 billion 
euros are implemented in France. One of the 
features of partnerships in France is maintain-
ing a balance between large and small public 
projects, which are implemented by local au-
thorities [3]. 

The term of public-private partnerships is 
usually understood as a special form of interac-
tion between business and state. The nature of 
this interaction, methods and specific forms of 
that cooperation significantly vary depeding 
upon national peculiarities of market relations 
and legal systems. 

In general, the system of partnership rela-
tions between the state, science,  private agri-
business and investors are based on two postu-
lates of the liberal conception of economic de-
velopment, namely: first, the formation of pri-
vate property institutes promotes activation of  
the processes of economic growth; the second, 
the economy based on private property, is more 
effective than the one  based on state ownership 
and direct public management [2]. 

Public-private partnership is a complicated 
institute from organizational, economic and le-
gal standpoint. It includes multilateral agree-
ments, risk sharing , analyses of economic per-
spectives and individual financing schemes, 
and legal support.  

Interestingly is that the public- private fund-
ing of public infrastructure projects is not an 
entirely new economic concept. Thus, at the 
turn of the 18th and 19th centuries the UK 
economy was restored due to the involvement 
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of private capital. In Ukraine, on the 1st of July 
2010 also there was adopted the Law  2404 –
VI "On Public- Private Partnerships",  which 
defined the organizational and legal framework 
of interaction between government and  private 
partners on the contractual basis [5]. According 
to the Law the features of public- private part-
nerships include the following: ensuring the 
highest technical and economic performance 
indicators; long-term relationship (from 5 to 50 
years); transfer some of the risks to the private 
partner; making investments by the private 
partner from legal sources into partnership fa-
cilities [5]. 

However, in most countries that have a posi-
tive practice in implementing projects under the 
public-private partnerships, one of the main 
features of it is considered that the mentioned 
mechanism is used to implement large-scale, 
national or international, either socially impor-
tant projects. The international practice has 
shown that the interaction between the state and 
private business has the greatest effect espe-
cially in infrastructure areas where historically 
the preconditions are created, as well as the 
need and opportunity for such a cooperation in 
the implementation of large-scale socio-
economic problems are ripe. 

In addition, the key features of public-
private partnerships usually include competitive 
method of selection and scanning partners, and 
the success of the project implementation based 
on the technology of public-private partnerships 
depends on the transparency of the tender, as 
far as only this method provides a selection of 
the most cost-beneficial project and a reliable 
partner. Unfortunately, Ukrainian legislation 
ignores these essential features. 

The basic principles of public-private part-
nerships include the following: 

public and private partners’ equality before 
the law; 

the prohibition of any discrimination  of 
public or private partners’ rights; 

reconciling the interests of public and pri-
vate partners in order to get mutual benefit; 

immutability of purpose and ownership of 
the objects that are in the state or communal 
form of ownership transferred to the private 
partner; 

 recognition by public and private partners 
the rights and obligations provided for by law 
and determined by the terms of the contract; 

equitable distribution of risks associated 
with the performance of contracts between pub-
lic and private partners 

The feasibility of the institute formation of 
public-private partnerships as a condition of 
increasing innovation and investment activity in 
agribusiness is due to several factors, namely; 

imbalance in the relationships that ensure the 
harmonization of interests and balance of par-
ticipants in interaction (the state, science, pri-
vate agribusiness, investors and agricultural 
producers) and the gaps occuring  in the system 
of relations between "power – business – sci-
ence – society”; 

dramatic changes in the economic environ-
ment of the state, the dominance of private 
ownership in agricultural business, and invest-
ment and financial institutions, which requires 
effective use of partnerships between power, 
science, investors and agribusiness; 

restriction of government investment re-
sources from direct involvement into the pri-
vate ownership of agribusiness, and the au-
thotity’s weak understanding of investors’ in-
terests, who possess powerful investment re-
sources, modern intellectual, organizational and 
economic potential; 

preservation of strategic regulators in the 
framework of state interests, and the need to 
increase their effectiveness through the benefits 
of collaboration between science, business and 
investors to cover costs and increase the profit-
ability of public investments; 

benefits derived from the partnerships be-
tween government, science, agribusiness and 
investors in various forms of its manifestation. 

The purpose of the formation of the institute 
of public-private partnerships as a condition of 
innovation and investment activity increasing in 
agribusiness is the development and growth of 
a competitive agricultural production. The fea-
tures of public-private partnerships levelled 
with other investment innovation mechanisms, 
consist in the fact that the partners pursue dif-
ferent goals and meet their specific challenges, 
thus the parties  have multi-vector mo-
tives. Technically, the backward and deterio-
rated  agribusiness infrastructure requires a sig-
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nificant financial investment and use of a new 
technology, and that the state alone under fi-
nancial and economic crisis is not able to pro-
vide. Accordingly, the main motivation of the 
state for projects implementation based on pub-
lic- private partnerships is the limited budget 
resources, as well as lack of relevant practice of 
economic entities effective management in 
market conditions.  

With respect to public-private partnerships 
the state pursues its both, internal and external 
purposes. The exterior result of public- private 
partnerships serves, in its broadest sense, the 
interests of the community as defined in the 
political and administrative areas. For this pur-
pose, the government is trying to stabilize 
within the framework of a partnership structure 
the development and profitability of agribusi-
ness, to restore degraded rural settlements, 
promote investments, improve the competitive-
ness of agribusiness, create jobs in rural areas, 
and to meet other social problems in rural ar-
eas. At the domestic level the state administra-
tions try to benefit from the market knowledge 
and business competencies of  private partners 
through performing tasks within the public-
private partnerships, also they try to reduce 
government spending and simultaneously find 
interested partners. Research institution re-
ceives  its share of income from the sale of in-
novative products under joint projects and joint 
activities of market actors in the form of royal-
ties and services payment [11].  

On the other hand, the objectives of private 
partners (investors, agribusiness) within the 
framework of public-private partnerships is to 
increase or support (at least in the long-term 
vision) stable profits. In addition, private part-
ners are seeking their businesses to remain 
competitive and expanded; they are looking for 
the opportunities to share or reduce risks  
Moreover, they want to increase their abilities 
to expand relations with public bodies, and 
promote rural development. This helps to im-
prove their external image. In this case, all par-
ties are interested in successful implementation 
of their priority and strategic projects in gen-
eral. 

Joint projects through public -private part-
nerships often facilitate access to global mar-
kets, stimulate the attraction of foreign invest-

ment in agribusiness to implement the innova-
tive projects.The public- private partnerships is 
of particular importance for the economies of 
rural areas, where it is the basis for the devel-
opment of rural markets of capital, goods and 
services. However, the interests of the state and 
business can not just be different, but contro-
versial. Therefore, mutual cooperation should 
be preceded by the negotiation of the  parties, 
thus  harmonizing economic interests and ob-
jectives of the projects [10, pp. 17-21]. 
The partner cooperation of state, science, pri-
vate investors and agribusiness allows to attract 
additional resources  into agribusiness, and in-
troduce innovations. In such a system of rela-
tions there is the union of financial resources 
and potentials of different economic actors, i.e. 
the state - in the form of its property, science - 
in the form of scientific potential and innova-
tion developments, agribusiness and investors 
as the use of modern economic and managerial 
methods, as well as attraction of investments 
and introduction of innovations. As a result 
there is improved the efficiency of resource 
use. For businessmen the partnership with the 
government means reduction of long-term risks 
while running businesses [1, p. 9]. 

The structure of innovation and investment 
projects of public-private partnerships may dif-
fer in different sub-sectors of agribusiness.  
There is no such a notion as a "standard pro-
ject" of public- private partnerships, since each 
innovative investment project and the agree-
ment is unique, posessing its individual proper-
ties. 

Within the framework of public-private 
partnerships there can be concluded agreements 
on concession, joint venture, production shar-
ing, and other contracts. Concession is the pro-
vision by the executive authorities or local gov-
ernment under a concession agreement on the 
charged basis to the legal entity or natural  per-
son right for the creation and management of 
the concession object under the term of taking 
by the concessionaire obligations for the crea-
tion and management of concessions object, 
property liability and probable business risk. A 
distinctive feature of the concession is that the 
state as one of the parties has a monopoly on 
certain resources or taking certain economic 
activities. Concessions are rather a universal 
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way for solving economic problems in Italy 
[9]. Today they are the most advanced progres-
sive form of partnerships between the state, lo-
cal authorities and the private sector. 

The advantages of implementing innovative- 
investment projects in agribusiness based on 
public- private partnerships are the following:  

reducing pressure on the state / local budget 
in the short term due to the transfer of budget 
expenditures for the following 15-20 years; 

improving the quality of agricultural pro-
duce, ensuring effective operation of the facil-
ity by the private partner; 

creating an object of a certain fixed value 
determined at the stage of the competition (op-
erating costs are indexed specifically on infla-
tion-based rate); 

using practice and professionalism of private 
agricultural business while keeping state con-
trol over assets; 

risk-sharing between the state and private 
business; 

promotion of a constructive dia-
logue between business and government. 

However, the implementation of innovative 
investment projects in agribusiness on public-
private partnership-basis  has the following dis-
advantages:  

creation of financial obligations of the state 
for the long term perspective; 

potentially high risk of significant govern-
ment spending in case of the agreement termi-
nation; 

lack of practice in implementing innovative 
investment projects in agribusiness on public- 
private partnership-basis, absence of high qual-
ity specialists on the side of the state partner; 

duration of the terms for innovation-
investment projects implementation in agri-
business, and inability to take into considera-
tion in the contract all probable risks,  including 
cyclicality of generating crisis phenomena; 

high costs on the stage of an innovative in-
vestment project design (the cost of technical-
economic substantiation, payment of consult-
ants, lawyers, auditors, holding tenders and 
conclusion of a contract); 

time lag between the implementation of in-
novative and investment projects and the ability 
to budget its implementation; 

budget does not display a specific project, 
there are no effective mechanisms to monitor 
its implementation; 

potentially high corruption component.  
The most important obstacles to the imple-

mentation of technologies of public-private 
partnership are: lack of interaction between the 
partners (26%), legal and regulatory issues 
(23%), lack of financial resources (23%), lack 
of businessmen’s motivation (8%) [7]. 

According to sociological research the 
"UNDP Public-Private Partnerships "of the the 
USA Agency for International Development 
found that: only 52% of the respondent repre-
sentatives of the authorities, 30% - of business, 
and 32% of  non-governmental organizations 
understand the nature of public-private partner-
ships; 

59% of the respondent representatives of the 
authorities, 78% - of business, and 71% of non-
governmental organizations are unaware of the 
Law of Ukraine "On Public-Private Partner-
ship; 

only 4% of respondents are familiar with the 
details of this Law, and 24% of them happened 
to hear about it; 33% of the respondents named 
the body responsible for the implementation of 
public-private partnerships; 78% of the respon-
dents know nothing about successful examples 
of implemented public-private partnerships [7]. 

Global integration processes, and rigid com-
petition require a transition of  agribusiness to 
the innovative way of development. The stated 
goal may be in the long view (even with the 
account of global economic crisis) achieved 
only through ensuring an adequate level of eco-
nomic freedom, creation of equal conditions for 
competitiveness, strengthening of property 
rights, as well as effective integration of gov-
ernment, science, education and business [6] 
enabling to enhance innovative activity, to con-
centrate financial resources on key areas of sci-
entific and technological progress, to create 
Ukrainian scientific and industrial innovation 
agrarian formations, able to compete success-
fully in the global market. 

Therefore, it is necessary to create the insti-
tute for public-private partnerships as a condi-
tion of increasing innovation and investment 
activity in  agribusiness, to build effectively 
operating innovative investment structures ena-
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bling to rapidly transform the agribusiness on a 
new basis. At that, the created  infrastructure 
subsystems should coordinate the provision of 
services and work as a single mechanism. The 
system elements that are responsible for the 
production of scientific and technological prod-
uct and its promotion in the market, should be 
the engineering firms, including subsidiaries of 
backbone elements. Without the use of the 
mechanisms for public-private partnership the 
solution of aforementioned tasks is impossible. 

The development of effective institutes for 
cooperation between the state  and business is 
to become one of the important conditions for 
the formation of an effective agricultural pol-
icy, also for the increased innovation and in-
vestment activity in agribusiness, and the de-
velopment of economic and social infrastruc-
ture in rural areas. That is, the need to develop 
the institute of public-private partnerships as a 
condition of increasing innovation and invest-
ment activity in agribusiness  is enhanced by 
the necessity to provide interaction between the 
public and private capital for development of 
science, technology and engineering. 

To enhance the motivational component in 
the formation of interaction mechanisms be-
tween state, science , investors, agribusiness it 
is appropriate to use co-financing of particu-
larly significant innovation and investment pro-
jects in agribusiness (direct funding and issu-
ance of guarantees), including participation in 
the authorized capital of the management com-
pany, to issue the public secures target bonds 
and loans; to prefer investors and creditors in 
channelling their  significant financial re-
sources, granting them the right to lease land; to 
reduce risks of private investors and banks for 
effective commercial agricultural projects by 
guaranteeing debt service or interest rate subsi-
dies; to invest the resources of the  pension ac-
cumulation system into innovative investment 
projects related to the development of agricul-
tural infrastructure; to provide the extra-
budgetary guarantee, i.e. the right to increase 
tariffs or extend the term of agreement in case 
of  absence of the investment cash flows to re-
turn. 

The government should realize that the sta-
bilization and modernization of agribusiness, 
development of rural territories - is the first of 

its duties, and not that of private investors and 
agribusiness. When the government is afraid to 
invest itself it can not stimulate a private inves-
tor. If the government sets ambitious targets to 
ensure food safety and to create a globally 
competitive agricultural production, it should 
put its efforts in innovation and investment de-
velopment in accordance with high standards 
and demands of the present. 

The question of whether the state, or private 
investors, or banks are to invest in a particular 
innovative project in agribusiness should be 
viewed from the angle of proper distribution of 
risks, availability of economic, financial, tech-
nological, and managerial expertise, also from 
the ignoring of current approach   that "public 
investment is inafficient, while private is effec-
tive".  There is no fundamental reason why the 
government investment should be less efficient 
than private. But to prove that the state should 
apply the same principles used by the private 
sector, and to invest into innovative agribusi-
ness projects, scanned  by private companies on 
a competitive basis [6]. 

As instruments for stimulating innovation 
processes and the development of agribusiness 
and rural infrastructure with application of 
mechanisms of public-private partnerships 
should be considered innovative investment 
projects that are a priority for the development 
of agribusiness, but do not get the required re-
sources from the private sector, because of high 
risks, length of payback period, the complexity 
of the necessary support tools and more. The 
state support of these projects can be achieved 
through both, direct crediting and borrowing, 
including these which are made together with 
private institutions, and by reducing risks 
(guarantees, credit insurance, etc.) that will en-
able  the important for the state innovation and 
investment projects to be invested by private 
agribusiness. 

Consequently, the state should not act as a 
source of budgeting for deliberately unprofit-
able projects, but as a catalyst for the invest-
ment processes of the priority areas and sectors 
of agribusiness with the attraction of private 
sector resources.  

Conclusions. In summary, it should be 
noted that in recent years the introduction of the 
public- private partnership institute was not a 
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major priority of the government strategic pro-
grams of innovation and investment develop-
ment of agribusiness, which is an indicator of a 
successful collaboration between business and 
structures of government power,  and an alter-
native way to restore and modernize agribusi-
ness. 

Being a relatively new phenomenon, a pub-
lic-private partnership in Ukraine has all 
chances to become an institutional tool for 
business updating based on uniting potential of 
the government and science with the invest-
ment, management and other resources of pri-
vate business. At the moment the objective cir-
cumstances are critical for the introduction of 
public- private partnership technologies. In or-
der to implement large-scale innovation pro-
jects in agribusiness substantial investment re-
sources are required, a powerful source of 
which may be private business. However, in 
terms of post-crisis development the interest of 
business grows to government support, which 
will allow to reduce the risks of private invest-
ment, and improve the reliability of innovation 
projects in agribusiness.  

It should be noted that in recent years the 
government has created certain preconditions 

for the expansion of public-private partnership 
practice in agribusiness, namely: the feedback 
of science, agribusiness investors and govern-
ment developed through public-private consul-
tations, and formation of self-governing busi-
ness organizations; the introduction of credit 
subsidies for agricultural producers;  the crea-
tion of institutions of special economic zones 
and technology parks. 

Public-private partnership is a necessary 
scenario for agribusiness as a symbiosis of pub-
lic and private support of innovations and high 
technologies will create incentives for its de-
velopment. However, in spite of the importance 
of these measures it can be stated that the proc-
ess of creating and using the  public-private 
partnerships technologies as a condition for  
increasing innovation and investment activity in 
agribusiness has just started. The movement in 
that direction should be significantly acceler-
ated, especially given the fact that the devel-
opment of the considered areas of interaction 
between state, science, investors and agribusi-
ness facilitates the motivation enhancement of 
the parties’ activities in the implementation of 
socially useful efforts within the framework of 
innovative agribusiness development. 
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