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Kushnir S.N. THE STATE CONTROL IN THE EDUCATION SPHERE AS A GOVERNANCE 
FUNCTION / Zaporizhzhya national university, Ukraine  

The article defines the notion of governance functions in the education sphere. The features of state 
control of education establishments in Ukraine as a component of state governance in the 
corresponding sphere are determined.  

The efficiency of governance and the adaptation of education establishment management in 
Ukraine to the changes that are currently taking place in this sphere, depend on and should include 
adaptation of the state control of the Ukrainian education establishments to the changes 
undergoing in the modern society.   

In order to realize the directions of the changes that the education control should undergo, first of 
all, it is important to form the integral conception of the place of education control in the system of 
the governance functions. This statement stands as  the purpose of this article and points out the 
topicality of the chosen topic. To gain the purpose stated above it is of necessity to state the 
peculiarities of the controllable system, to define the notion of the functions of governance in the 
education sphere, to determine the characteristics of state control of Ukrainian education 
establishments as a component of governance in the corresponding sphere.  

Foremost, it should be pointed out that the system of education governance in Ukraine is a 
complex structured multilevel system that is caused by the complexity of structure of Ukrainian 
education system. Thus, Ukrainian education system consists of education, scientific and 
methodological establishments, scientific and production enterprises, state and local education 
governing bodies and institutions of local government in the education sphere.  

Such complexity of the manageable system causes the diversity of management types in the 
education sphere and at the same time unsolved or ambiguously solved management questions. 

The types of governance in the education sphere comprise management of human resources, 
financial system, budget process and public relations, etc.  
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The education governance foresees such functions of the state as organisation, planning, 
coordination and control. The development of these functions enables to solve the tasks of the 
secondary education and thus contributes to its improvement and further effective development.  

The education establishments state control is a component of governance, namely, it is one of the 
general inner functions of the strategical governance of the education system.  

Without denying the principle of state and public education management in Ukraine, we 
emphasize the importance of the combination of state and public control in the education sphere as 
a precondition of the effective management of the corresponding system.  

Control is an element of state power that provides keeping to social regulators namely normative 
and individual orders, the behaviour of parties under control in order to eliminate possible 
departures from the stated norm. Though, we should realise the necessity of defining the limits of 

considered to be problematic.  

However, we cannot take drastic measures and transfer all or majority of functions to other 
controlling bodies apart from the state.  

It should be pointed out that the structural and multilevel organisation of education establishments 
system in Ukraine is one of the guarantees of the internal control efficiency. However, the control 
reduction to the internal type is an exaggeration. The combination of different types of education 
establishments state control is appropriate for carrying out tasks and functions placed on 
corresponding system.  

The necessity of the existence of such system is easily explained as the transition towards new 
political and economic basis of our society has not reduced the drawbacks in the governance 
sphere and governing decisions taken by the higher authorities of the executive branch are not 
considered to be flawless.  

The new conditions of governing activity demand reconsideration of tasks, forms and methods of 
control realisation but, anyway, we should not eliminate the corresponding system.  

Being a function of governance the control has the specific content and it is realised with the help 
of specific management methods and forms. Simultaneously the control as a function of 
governance has its specificity. The control as a definite activity can be viewed as an independent 

ons.  

The general functions of governance are defined concretely in the functions of separate bodies, 
organization department and functional positions. This circumstance is the basis for defining the 
competence of structural units. The governance division into functions reflects the specificity 
inside it. The functional division of labour is assigned in the form of structure namely the specific 
chains are created which duty is to plan, register and control. The organisation severability is an 
important indication of the function developed and large in scope. Thus, the control can be viewed 
as a component of administrative, organisational, governing and production activity and as a 
separate element of the economic, organisational or other activities. This conclusion can be drawn 
for those state or other bodies that hold the control as their main duty. The control gains the 
character of an independent kind of state activity for those state bodies that are only called upon to 
exercise the controlling activity.  

Taking into consideration everything mentioned above, we can state that the state control in the 
education sphere is a part of governance. Particularly, the control is a general inner function of 
efficient management of the corresponding complex system and it is manifested as a main, unique 
or additional activity of controlling parties in the predetermined forms and with the established 
methods and with the definite aim.  
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