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ENRICHING OF GALANTINIV BY CALCIUM AND FOOD FIBRES 

 
An increase in the needs of the Ukrainian population in health and prophylactic 

products has led to the emergence and development of a new direction in the 
development and production of meat products using non-traditional resources of 
plant material that is not used at all or is not rational. According to experts, reducing 
disease, social and economic factors, should contribute to sufficient production and 
normal food consumption of mass demand.  

Health and prophylactic products are designed to help prevent disease, improve 
protection functions and create conditions to improve the body's ability to resist the 
adverse effects of the environment. 

In the conditions of modern economic society development in the diet of a large 
part of the population of Ukraine is a relatively low content of not just vitamins, 
macro-and micronutrients, and dietary fiber. So, the total consumption of fiber and 
pectin is less than 10 g per day, which is almost twice less than optimal amounts. 

While the study examined a large number of raw materials of plant and animal 
origin in terms of its possible use as a source of complete protein, dietary fiber, and 
essential, for prevention of some diseases, macro-and micronutrients. As a result of 
the comparative analysis of the chemical composition of different kinds of plant 
material for research were selected almonds and sesame seeds, as most rich in 
calcium and iron, and dietary fiber are carrot, which contain significant amounts of 
carotene. 

The results of organoleptic and physicochemical research found the rational 
number in the meat products (galantiny). Galantinov estimation of organoleptical 
survey showed improvement in their organoleptic characteristics with a rational 
number for receipt of almonds and sesame seeds - 2%, a carrot fibers – 1,5 % on 100 
% raw. 

Determination of the content of mineral substances results in baked galantinah 
testify to the enrichment of the product groups of calcium, iron and magnesium. The 
baked galantinah recipe depending on the mineral content, mg/100 g calcium – 43,86 
– 44,52 (in the control sample 31,25), iron – 1,81 – 2,13 (in the control sample 1,62), 
magnesium – 83,86 – 89,37 (in the control sample 62,22). 

Key words: galantini, sesame seed, carrot fibres, almond, meat, oligoelementss, 
macronutrients, technology, prophylaxis, feed. 
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