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Short history of NATO School Oberammergau

The NATO School originated in 1953 when
General Mathew B. Ridgeway, then Supre-
me Allied Commander, Europe (SACEUR),
directed the Special Weapons Branch of the
U.S. Army School at Oberammergau to teach
two courses on strategy and related develop-
ments of conventional and nuclear weapons
to allied officers and senior civilians. In 1966,
the Special Weapons Branch became the
NATO Weapons System Department and
was placed under the operational control of
SACEUR. The curriculum was expanded by
adding four more courses. These are still
taught today, although they are continually
revised and updated to include the most cur-
rent developments within Allied Command
Transformation and NATO. In 1973, the De-
partment became the NATO Weapons Sys-
tems School. The School remained under the
operational control of SACEUR, but it was
assigned to United States European Com-
mand (USEUCOM) as a separate joint ser-
vice activity. The NATO School was char-
tered and received its present name in 1975.

Since its beginning in 1953, more than
70,000 officers, non-commissioned officers
and civilians from all allied and national mili-
tary commands within the NATO area have
attended courses at the school. Several
courses are also open to students from Part-
nership for Peace (PfP), Mediterranean Dia-
logue and Contact nations bringing the total
number of countries that have sent students
to 59. Currently, the NATO School teaches
85 different courses to over 10,000 students
each year covering topics ranging from
weapons employment to peacekeeping to ori-
entation to NATO. The expanded role of the
School is reflected in its staff and faculty. To-
day it employs more than 180 civilian and
military personnel from 23 of the 26 NATO
countries and two PfP nations.

To ensure students are continually abreast
of the most current information on Alliance
matters, faculty members consistently re-
ceive reports from, and occasionally travel to
NATO Facilities/Centers/Commands, and to
national capitals and commands to gather
up-to-date information. Even visits to Oper-
ations (i.e. ISAF in Afghanistan) are carried
out. More importantly, students and faculty
regularly hear the views of numerous politi-
cal leaders and civilian and military experts
who make presentations at the School. Fac-
ulty members also make presentations out-
side the NATO School through the use of
Mobile Education Training Teams. Not only
have faculty members lectured within the
NATO borders but also outside, for example
in Algeria and Russia. The school also hosts
various conferences. Through the years, sev-
eral NATO associated groups have used the
school’s facilities and enjoyed the surround-
ings of the local Bavarian community.

Since June 2003, the school is under opera-
tion control of Allied Command Transforma-
tion (SACT) in Norfolk, Virginia, U.S. A
board of advisors, consisting of members of
the SACT staff, provides assistance and
guidance to the School. Germany and
USJFCOM provide facility and logistic sup-
port. However, the school relies on tuition
fees of students to offset its operating costs.
The school is essentially self-supporting. In
2008 NATO School welcomed about 10,500
officers, non-commissioned officers (NCOs),
and civilians from all allied and national mili-
tary commands within the NATO Alliance,
and from 61 nations.

Advaced Distributed Learning — ADL History

In the 1990s it was realized Education and
Training NATO has to move with new edu-
cation technologies. At the 1999 NATO Sum-
mit in Washington, the NATO / PfP
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Training and Education Enhancement
Programme (TEEP) was created. At the fol-
lowing summits it was stressed that the Alli-
ance should focus on further development in
education and training for NATO. The initia-
tive was further discussed at the following
summits in 2002, Prague, 2004, Istanbul,
2006, Riga and 2008 at Bucharest. Today
ADL is widely accepted among NATO and
Partner Education and Training Facilities.
Since the first ADL Course was produced in
2002, about 100 ADL courses followed, pro-
duced by the different NATO/PfP Educa-
tion and Training facilities.

ADL at NATO School

NATO School supported NATO/PfP ADL
efforts from the beginning and established in
2005 the NATO School ADL Office, which is
now responsible for any ADL and online ed-
ucation efforts. Currently NATO School has
over 30 ADL courses online, which are sup-
porting various resident courses. The idea is
the offer NATO School students a basic in-
formation about the course topic to allow
them to inform themselves prior attending a
NATO School course. ADL for pre-learning
purposes, as used at NATO School, can be a
very useful tool to support resident courses.
This allows the course director and the lec-
tures to presume certain knowledge on each
course topic and address the audience on
more detailed issues of the topic. In addition
to that ADL must not be seen as a strict
pre-learning tool, ADL offers a widespread
possibility in individual training and learn-
ing, e.g. instructor lead course preparation,
e-readings and the building of communities
of practise. By using ADL in different ways
the Course Director can focus on the specials
needs of his audience and tailor not only the
ADL course, but especially the resident
course to the needs and wishes of the stu-
dents. Besides the pre-learning ADL courses,
NATO School’s ADL Office produced also
courses of broader interest, which give stu-
dents supplementary information on current
NATO topics, such as e.g. Terrorism, Traf-
ficking in Human Beings, Rules of Engage-
ment, Procurement and Contracting.

How ADL can enrich the resident courses

Any instructor or teacher is aware of the
challenge to reach the audience. The diffi-
culty for each instructor to get the informa-
tion through the different media filters, ide-
ally, into the “long term memory”. We all
know that best results can be achieved by
stimulating as much sense as possible, to get
the attention of the student, by managing

not to overwhelm him with the impact of the
learning material.

Reaching the long-term memory is a chal-
lenge for each source of information. For
ADL that means that the online module
needs to be presented in a very attractive
way, to avoid regrets or boredom. — In order
to achieve that, an ADL module needs to
stimulate as much sense as possible, for ex-
ample the audio-visual by offering not only
text bodies, but also video and audio files on
a certain topic. The aim is to keep the stu-
dents attention throughout the whole course
on a very high level, to motivate them to
read through the whole course. Ideally each
single lesson within an ADL module should
not only provide the students information,
but also interactivity and the chance to re-
peat the learned topic.

The benefit of having an ADL module as
an additional training offer to the resident
course becomes apparent by looking on the
legality of learning and forgetting, which is
related to each other. Once a student gets in
contact with the topic it takes quite a time
till he learns it. A lot or recurrences are nec-
essary to gain a certain level of knowledge.
Once that person stops repeating the topic
the process of forgetting starts. Of course a
certain amount of the learned material will
kept, but it is counter productive to the
learning effort. But once that person gets in
contact with the same material it takes less
time to reach the aimed level of knowledge.
For NATO School that means that full ADL
courses are the good way to ensure that the
students gain the required knowledge within
one week. The idea is to use the ADL course
not only as the preparation but as the online
learning tool. It should not only give a few
basic instructions, the ADL courses should
give the students all necessary information
on a special topic and the resident course will
strengthen them.

ADL courses can gap that problem by of-
fering the students the possibility to get fa-
miliar with the course content. The resident
course could be than the reoccurrence as
well as the absorption of the learned mate-
rial. By doing so the ADL course supports not
only the resident course as a pre learning
tool, it also help the student to repeat the
subject once he left NATO School and feels
to need to refresh the learned material.

Last but not least ADL courses are not only
beneficial for the students they also help to
increase the quality of the resident courses.
A well prepared ADL courses which match
the resident program can not only bring the
students on a basic level of knowledge, ADL
can be used as the entrance ticket to a vari-
ety of training possibilities. Most important
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for each single ADL course is to focus on the
reusability and the maintainability to avoid
annual changes and updates. Furthermore
the ADL content has to match a few quality
standards to ensure that each single NATO
School ADL course is a valuable training tool.

Transforming the NATO Education and Training
with Web-based Collaboration

Throughout 2008, students and faculty
have been developing a robust virtual com-
munity to support their educational and
training goals. Keeping pace with innovative
business practices that incorporate
Web-based social networking, the NATO
School has tailored an online capability to en-
hance the learning experience. “We took a
cautious approach toward technology adop-
tion,” said Col James Tabak, USMC, NATO
School Commandant. “As the year pro-
gressed, the academic staff and students re-
sponded enthusiastically. The user numbers
exceed all predictions.”

At first, the NATO School saw the portal
as a solution for distributing course materi-
als, when reproducing thousands of
CD-ROMS per year became unsustainable.

Yet, it quickly exceeded expectations as it
solved the file storage problem and then be-
gan to open up new channels for communica-
tion and collaboration. In contrast to tradi-
tional websites that serve only as data repos-
itories, the NATO School members portal al-
lows for multi-way communication. Mem-
bers can read information and download files
as well as make comments and post docu-
ments to share. Additionally, the portal pro-
vides the means to communicate directly
with others. Seeing a colleague online, it is
possible to start chatting via the instant mes-
senger program. With all its functionality
and potential applications, the portal acts as
“a superb enabler of the blended learning so-
lutions being developed at NATO School,”
said LCdr Karl Boucher, a Training Devel-
opment Officer in the Standards, Evaluation
and Training Department. Applications in-
clude event and course planning, collabora-
tive research, and the development of Ad-
vanced Distributed Learning (ADL) projects.

For courses, the portal provides new op-
portunities for participants to collaborate to-
gether. And an increasing number are taking
advantage of the capability. As of November
2008, fifty course working groups were on-
line, up from ten in February. Some courses
use the collaborative working groups to im-
prove interaction among participants, while
others use calendar and notification features
to coordinate activities. Other “early
adopter” faculty members are experiment-

ing with Web-based interactivity that en-
riches the residence course experience. “I
have transformed the way I conduct syndi-
cate sessions by utilizing collaborative CBRN
groups on the NATO School Members’ Por-
tal,” said LTC Zden�k Vr�bel, a Course Di-
rector in the Weapons of Mass Destruction
Department. “The groups exchange informa-
tion in real time via the portal and I can
track and comment on the progress,” he said.
Additionally, all course materials from lec-
tures to briefings to pictures are posted for
students to download when they return to
their duty stations.

CDR Ioan Craciun, a Course Director in
the Joint Operations Department sees appli-
cability of the technology before and after
the residence course. He uses NATO School
Members portal to provide students access to
materials and to tap into their experiences.
Before arrival, they have the chance to build
a foundation of knowledge for the course by
accessing read-ahead materials and meeting
each other online. After graduation, students
can return to the online group to interact. “I
would like to focus their effort on the course
subject and give them the opportunity to
share their experience anywhere and any-
time,” he said. In this manner, alumni will be
able to keep abreast of the latest develop-
ments in their area of expertise and with
new developments at the NATO School.

Beyond specific courses, students and fac-
ulty may use the collaborative portal to build
communities of practice — groups that
emerge from shared interests and expertise.
Connections made in residence may spark
further discussions within online groups
whose membership cut across disciplines,
courses and years.

For faculty, the portal is a helpful planning
and coordination tool. A number of Course
Directors use the portal to establish and
maintain contact with guest speakers and
subject matter experts (SMEs) outside the
NATO School. As the portal is web-based,
SMEs can still access the portal and specified
working groups. The collaborative environ-
ment provides an effective workspace to as-
semble course content, design course mod-
ules, track and discuss feedback, and estab-
lish maintenance schedules for updates to
courses.

Looking ahead, the NATO School ADL
team, which provides the support and train-
ing for the portal, will continue to work with
the faculty on how best to take advantage of
the portal capabilities. Additionally, up-
grades and refinements are anticipated,
which may include an integrated Learning
Management System. In this way, partici-
pants will have direct access to online
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courses alleviating the need to register sepa-
rately. Also the ADL team is coordinating
with developers and website managers from
other institutions in the NATO/PfP Educa-
tion and Training Network to expand oppor-
tunities to share information, coordinate ac-
tivities, and discover new connections.

Facts:
– NATO School Course participants have

access to the most updated version of the
course materials after a resident course,
through the NATO School Members Por-
tal.

– Collaborative learning supports and ex-
tends existing formal learning.

– NATO School Members portal exceeded
105 GB of data traffic in 2008 which is the
equivalent of a library floor of academic
journals.

– As of August 1, 2009, over 5500 members
are part of the NATO School Members
Portal.

ADL at NATO School — The Way Ahead

Since the first NATO/PfP ADL Course
was produced tremendous changes have
been made in the way of producing courses.
The current trend is to move away form so
called “page turners” to more interactive
courses. The new ADL courses should not
only inform the students, the trend is to over
a well online course, which is interesting and
informative at the same time. In this light

also the discussion of certification for stu-
dents of ADL courses is more and more dis-
cussed lately. Furthermore students have the
desire to stay in contact with their former
classmates and instructors after attending
the course, as part of the idea of continuous
learning. NATO School is working on keep-
ing up to date with the new trends in online
education, by offering students interesting
and interactive online courses, as well as
with the NATO School Members’ Portal an
online collaboration environment accessible
anytime anywhere, for course directors, in-
structors and students to share course mate-
rial online, and share their knowledge and
expertise with online Communities of Prac-
tice. When discussing new trends in ADL one
should forget that besides all the great tools,
a good content is where all starts. Only if the
content for the ADL course is good written
the final product will a useful tool for in-
structors and students. To access online
courses from NATO School, log in to the
NATO School Members Portal. You will find
here the most updated list of online courses
available anytime and anywhere you have
access to internet.
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